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Avery grabbed Hayden’s arm with one hand and tried to stand up from the wheelchair. 

“Mom, do you want to go down?” Hayden supported his mother with both hands and 
carefully helped her get down from the wheelchair, “This basement has been completely 
dug up. We can see the whole basement from here.” 

 

Qin An Ann stretched her neck and stared. 

“This side is the first entrance, and that side is the manhole cover.” Hayden pointed 
Avery’s direction, “Mom, Elliot will not be there until we find you.” 

“Where did he go? When did he go? Who took him away?” Avery looked at Hayden and 
asked a series of questions. 

Hayden: “I don’t know. But one thing is certain, Elliot was taken away from the first 
entrance. Because the manhole cover was welded to death.” 

“Have you found Sasha?” Avery endured, “This liar who tells a lot of lies! If I see her, I 
have to kill her myself!” 

“Mom, she didn’t go back to her hometown. Maybe she’s not in Yonroeville anymore.” 
Hayden helped his mother to sit down in the wheelchair, “Layla called me and asked 
when I and you will go home. I said we will be back soon.” 

“Hayden, I don’t want to go back.” Avery said, “Your dad may still be suffering… He may 
still be waiting for us to find him… I can’t give up on him…” 

“No one gave up on him.” Hayden Correcting his mother’s words, “These houses were 
leveled and the basement was dug up, all because of the determination to find him.” 

Hayden continued to add, “Mom, if you don’t go back, Uncle Mike will be able to hide it. 
If Layla and Robert know what happened to you, the two of them will definitely cry 
together.” 

Avery lowered her head, not knowing how to answer her son’s words. 

She didn’t want to leave here, but she didn’t want to leave the child alone. 

Her heart was conflicted and divided, and she wished to jump out of the wheelchair now 
and find Elliot all over the world, but she was so weak now that she couldn’t exert any 
strength. 



After a while, there was a roar from behind. 

A helicopter circled behind them and landed slowly. 

“Mom, let’s go back to Aryadelle first!” Hayden coaxed his mother patiently, “If you care 
so much about Elliot, I will send someone to look for it together.” 

Avery listened to her son’s words and felt sad: “Hayden, he is youy Dad. He is not our 
enemy. I thought I could fool myself by pretending I wasn’t there! But I found that I 
couldn’t fool myself! If he was still alive, I would never quarrel with him again, never with 
him again separated, let alone anger him on purpose. I want to be with him forever!” 

Hayden didn’t expect his mother to say these words to him. 

“Avery, since you love him so much, then you should go back to Aryadelle first, take 
good care of your body, and take care of your children.” Nick walked over to her and 
looked at her haggard and sad appearance, “Once we find Elliot’s If he falls, he will be 
found at any cost and sent back to you.” 

Avery had no other choice. 

They all said that Elliot was no longer in Yonroeville. It would be useless for her to stay 
here. 

When she was put into the helicopter, a thought suddenly flashed through her mind. 

“Will Elliot be taken away like this?” She said sternly, “You said that he couldn’t be 
found at the airport or the station… Then is it possible that he was also taken away by a 
helicopter?” 

But if Elliot left more information in Yonroeville, they wouldn’t be able to find him 
completely. 

“This possibility is not ruled out.” Chad answered, “The special plane will have a record 
when it flew over the territory of Yonroeville. I will ask someone to check the flight 
records of the special plane in Yonroeville in the past few days.” 

The helicopter arrived after nearly ten hours of flight in Aryadelle. 

After Avery got off the plane, he saw the ambulance coming to pick him up. 

“I’m not going to the hospital.” Avery resisted, “I’ll be on the drip at home.” 

“Okay, listen to you.” Mike told the ambulance to leave. 



Listening to her voice, although it is not as clear and loud as usual, but she can speak, it 
shows that the problem is not serious. 
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On the way back, Mike rubbed his palms. After hesitating for a moment, he said to 
Avery: “I haven’t told Layla yet… But Layla has already noticed that something 
happened to you. I let her Come pick you up with me, she won’t come.” 

Avery’s lips moved, but she couldn’t make a sound. 

 

Even if they hide it from the child, one day the child will see it from the mouths of others 
and on the news. 

Foster family. 

Mrs. Cooper cooked a table full of sumptuous dishes and waited eagerly at the gate of 
the courtyard. 

Layla and Robert were pestering in the living room. The siblings did not play with toys 
and did not eat. 

Robert wanted to go into the yard, but Layla grabbed his hand and wouldn’t let him out. 

Layla was in a bad mood and wanted someone to accompany her. 

In recent days, she has been secretly calling her mother and father, but she has never 
gotten through. 

She asked Mike why she still couldn’t get through to her parents. Mike was vague and 
avoided talking about it. She’s not a three-year-old who doesn’t understand anything, 
and she’s not a fool. 

She couldn’t contact her parents for such a long time, it must be because her parents 
had an accident. But yesterday Mike told her that her mother was coming back. 

While she was happy, she asked Mike, is Dad coming back too? As a result, Mike said 
only that her mother was coming back. 

Mike almost didn’t tell her directly that her father is not coming back! 

As for why Elliot didn’t come back, Mike can’t tell you. Because he’s afraid Layla won’t 
be able to accept it if Layla knows the truth. 



After the black car appeared at the gate of the courtyard, the bodyguard opened the 
gate. 

The car drove slowly into the front yard. 

“Dad!” Seeing the car coming in, Robert ran away from Layla like a fly and ran towards 
the yard. 

Robert thought that Mom and Dad came back together, so the little guy was very happy. 

“Stinky brother! Dad didn’t come back!” Layla ran out after him. 

The door opened, Hayden got out of the car first and went to the trunk to get a 
wheelchair. 

Mike helped Avery out of the car. 

Robert was curious when he saw the wheelchair. His big bright eyes stared at the 
wheelchair without blinking. 

“Mom, why are you in a wheelchair?” Layla walked up to her mother, stared at her face, 
and looked carefully, “Are you sick again? Where’s my dad?” 

Avery thought about to tell the truth to her child when she was in the car. 

“Your father is gone.” Avery took a deep breath, and the moment she said this, her 
voice became hoarse, “I don’t know where he is now, or if he is still alive… Layla, I’m 
sorry, I lost your father.” 

“Avery, how can you say that? This matter has nothing to do with you.” Chad was afraid 
that Layla would misunderstand Avery, and immediately explained to her, “Layla, you 
Mom and Dad were led to a basement by bad guys. They were trapped in that 
basement with no food, no water, no signal. When your brother found your mom, we 
found out that your dad was gone.” 

Layla heard the full story After that, tears welled up. 

 


