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Although just freshly woken up, she instantly regretted her actions last night. She 
regretted questioning his performance ability, which prompted him to work extra hard to 
debunk her doubt. As a result, he had not given her much chance to rest throughout the 
night. 

She recalled the words she had told him the night before. “Captain Lloyd, please!” 

“Richie, stop!” 

Nonetheless, Angela had experienced a night that she was reluctant to recall. 

“What‘s wrong? Weren‘t you a little daredevil last night?” Richard chuckled in a low 
voice and planted a kiss on her forehead. 

At that moment, she planted her face into his arms. “How dare you bring up anything 
from last night!” 

“Hehe…” He could not contain his giggle as he glanced at her tenderly and with full 
resignation. “I couldn‘t help it. After all, I had been suppressing myself for the past 
twenty–nine years.” 

As soon as Angela heard that, she laughed gleefully. His words were a clear indication 
that this was his first experience too. Come to think about it, I‘ve scored! Hold on. This is 
my first time too. 

“Are you for real? You‘re not lying to me, are you?” She lifted her bright–red face and 
she looked enchanting under the morning glow. 

At that moment, Richard felt a flutter in his heart as he ruffled her hair. “I will never lie to 
you.” His words were firm and sincere. 

Angela felt a warm and fuzzy feeling rise up within her as she reached out to cling to his 
neck. She leaned against his chest at ease. “You‘re not allowed to lie to me or leave 
me, ever. I will be your responsibility for the rest of your life.” 

He hugged her tightly and whispered into her ears, “Sure, I will take full responsibility for 
the rest of your life.” 

“Okay! I want to be hugged tightly to sleep by you every night from today onward.” She 
lifted her head and looked at him with doe eyes, looking innocent yet seductive. 



“Sure!” He dropped a kiss on her forehead and noticed that the blanket had slid off her 
body. There were some reddened marks on her skin and he kissed the spot with a 
distressed expression. 

Angela lowered her head and saw that too as she blushed. “You were so rough last 
night.” 

“I’m sorry,” Richard apologized in a hoarse voice. 

“I‘m thirsty and I want some water.” Indeed, the spoiled princess could not shake off her 
habit overnight. Fluttering her eyelashes, she looked at him with indication for him to 
fetch her some water. 

The man smiled in response and stroked her on the nose before getting up. As soon as 
he rose, his firm and well–toned back was revealed to her. 

Angela saw his back and her eyes widened in surprise instantly. Subsequently, she 
blinked and shifted her eyes guiltily; his back was horrific–looking! It must be some wild 
cat that did that! She would never admit to inflicting such wounds on him. 
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Hmm? She recalled the past events and realized that it seemed to have been her own 
doing. Within split seconds, her face flushed redder than ever. How did I even do that?! 

By then, Richard had brought a glass of water over for her and personally held the glass 
to her mouth. “Get up. Let‘s go for breakfast.” 

“Are you in a hurry to head home?” asked Angela. 

These Strange Ways Will Keep Your Relationship Strong Day To Day 

“I‘m not.” 

“How about staying for another day? I just want to spend some time with you right now.” 
She refused to give up this chance to be with him. After all, she wanted to give him 
some sweet memories to recall if he really went off for the mission. 

“Sure.” He nodded and agreed. 



After breakfast, they took a stroll outside until Angela felt tired again, so they went back 
into the room to take a nap. She wanted to hug him as she took a nap, but it was then 
the man‘s urges returned. 

She was quite a naughty one as well. Despite being well aware that Richard was trying 
hard to suppress himself, she purposely tried to provoke himn. Once again, she was 
held beneath him as he straddled her. “Umph, Richard, don‘t you dare…” However, her 
cries of protest were instantly muffled by him and the intimacy level in the air gradually 
intensified. 

“I love you.” Angela heard his hoarse voice confess his love and she beamed widely as 
she became submerged in the passionate throes. 

They stayed by the seaside for three full days and Richard sent her home after their trip 
at last. Along the way back, she could not help her emotions and stayed silent. 

She was so happy for the past three days, but after the happy moments, she knew that 
she had to accept the fact that he was due to leave soon. 

She was aware that Richard‘s expression had tensed up after the phone call he 
received, so she knew that he had to depart for his mission soon. 

After entering the town area, her heart clenched even tighter as they approached her 
home. At that moment, the man decided to speak up, “Angela, I‘ve got something to tell 
you.” 
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Angela heaved a tiny sigh as she thought, Ultimately, he‘s going to be forthcoming with 
me, huh? 

“You don‘t have to say anything. I know what you‘re about to say. You‘re about to 
embark on a dangerous mission.” She lifted her head and glanced at him with a worried 
expression. 

At that moment, Richard was slightly stunned. How did she find out? 

“Your mom told me about it. I have no intention of stopping you, but all I want is for you 
to return in one piece.” She looked at him unwaveringly, yet there was an expectant 
glimmer in her eyes. “I want you to come back to me safe and sound.” 



Richard parked his car by the front of her house and glanced at her hopeful, little face 
before reaching out to stroke the back of her head. “Don‘t worry. I‘ll definitely come back 
safe and sound.” 

“You must keep your promise.” Angela‘s eyes were red–rimmed at that point and she 
could not seem to stop herself from tearing up. Over the past three days, she had tried 
her best to avoid thinking about this matter, but she knew that she had to face it 
ultimately. 

“I promise I will,” he responded solemnly. 

“I need you to swear.” She was not satisfied with his promise. “Swear on my life. If you 
don‘t return, then I‘ll even sacrifice my life just to be with you.” 

At that point, he felt a pang in his heart as he replied hoarsely, “Stop that nonsense.” 

Teary–eyed, she smiled and shook her head. “I‘m serious.” 

“Trust me. I‘ll definitely come back safely.” Richard gave his word firmly. 

Meanwhile, Angela lowered her head and glanced at her abdomen. Subsequently, she 
turned to smile at him. “Once you‘re back, you might even become a father then.” 
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Instantly, the man‘s eyes widened. “Didn‘t you say… it was a safe window?” 

She shook her head and revealed a smug look. “I lied to you. That‘s why you must 
come back because I‘m sure you wouldn‘t want your child to address someone else as 
Daddy.” 

Her words infuriated him, yet he could not contain his excitement. He reached out and 
grabbed the back of her head before kissing her roughly. “Don‘t you dare marry 
someone else!” Angela‘s eyes were firm and unwavering as she negotiated, “Come 

home, then. If you do, then I promise not to marry anyone else but you!” 

“Okay.” Richard placed his forehead against hers and promised. 

Angela had done everything that she could to ensure that he came back and this was 
the most effective way she could think of. Despite the potential dangers involved in this 
mission, he had to come back alive because he had a major responsibility right here. 



His grandpa would be fine as he had the security of being taken care of by the.. country 
while his mother had her husband‘s company. However, he was solely responsible for 
Angela and their baby. 

“I‘ll definitely be back. Trust me.” Richard planted a kiss on her forehead after saying 
that. 

She reached out to hug him as well. “I’ll wait for you.” 

She alighted from his car and watched as his car disappeared into the horizon. 
However, she stubbornly refused to shed a single tear. 

She knew that in the near future, she would be living in long waiting days and worry. As 
long as he was away, she would not be able to feel at ease. 

Angela took some time to recollect herself as she did not want to show her family 
members her anxiety. The last thing she wanted was for her parents to worry. 

That afternoon, she received a phone call from Richard, informing that he was already 
on the plane. For the subsequent period of time, his phone would be switched off, so he 
wanted her to be at ease and wait for his good news. 

Angela remained positive on the phone as she was confident that he would be back. 

However, that night itself, she had trouble sleeping and she was up the entire night. She 
finally fell asleep in the morning and woke up in the afternoon. It was then she received 
a phone call from Scarlet, who invited her to go shopping with her in order to purchase 
some new clothes. 

Angela was aware that Scarlet was just trying to fill up her void during this period. 

As such, Scarlet‘s car pulled over discreetly in front of Angela‘s house. Since both 
families had not met each other before, Scarlet did not plan on entering the Meyers 
Residence as a guest. She picked up Angela and headed off to an exclusive shop in the 
town center. It was a relaxing afternoon with some teatime chit–chatting. 

“Angela, don‘t worry. Do you know what my son‘s nickname is? Everyone addresses 
him as ‘Zeus‘ because he is such a mighty and powerful figure, who never failed any of 
his missions. I‘m sure that he will definitely succeed in this one and come back 
victorious too.” 

As soon as Angela heard that, she felt much better than before as she nodded. “Yup. 1 
trust him too.” 

Truth be told, Scarlet was used to such anxiety as she used to worry about her husband 
the same way she worried about her son now. 



My Baby’s Daddy Chapter 1030 

Chapter 1030 

 

“Oh, I have a god–daughter and I‘ll introduce you guys to each other next time. She‘s 
studying abroad and gaining a master‘s degree in interpretation. She‘ll be back soon.” 

“That sounds great. I would love to get to know her. She must be very outstanding.” 

“Her parents are extremely close friends of ours and we have known each other for 
ages. They have been permanently stationed abroad for work, so this kid grew up by 
my side ever since she was a child. I regard her as my daughter.” 

“Yea, I‘ve heard about that from Richard.” 

“Her name is Ruka Singed. You can call her Ruka.” 

“She sounds like an adorable girl,” Angela replied with a smile. 

“She‘s two years younger than you and she‘s indeed a wonderful girl,” Scarlet 
mentioned with a smile. 

After their enjoyable afternoon tea, Scarlet sent Angela back home at about 5.00PM. 
Besides, she also reminded Angela to seek her out anytime to chat if she was feeling 
down in the dumps. 

At that point, Angela felt her spirits lifted significantly and she knew that she should not 
continue to wallow in self–pity. She had to keep her spirits up and wait for Richard to 
return. 

He had an invincible presence in her mind, so she trusted that he would definitely be 
able to overcome everything. 

Meanwhile, in a distant gorge far away from the town center of Lauchrist, several black–
colored SUVs silently traveled through the forest in the dark. The cars in the fleet were 
covered with green fabric as camouflage and they were practically invisible to the eye. 

“Send our striker team ahead to scout the route.” An instruction from their captain 
sounded through the headset. 

At that moment, the car came to a halt and a young man sitting next to the captain 
opened the car door and alighted. Roy grabbed the man‘s wrist. “Richard, why are you 
getting out of the car?” 



“Captain Anderson, I‘ll join the striker team.” 

“Get back here immediately,” Captain Anderson instructed sternly. “You‘re not allowed 
to go.” 

“I know that you have received instructions from my uncle to keep me safe, but my job 
here is as one of your men and I‘m not here to be protected.” Richard finished his words 
and struggled out of Captain Anderson‘s grip before leaving the car. 

Captain Anderson had no other choice and he could merely watch as the striker team 
disappeared into the dark. 

“Captain Anderson, this mission is much more difficult than the others. I heard that there 
are a few hundred men guarding the place, so the chances of us succeeding in rescuing 
Professor Tesla are quite slim.” 

“Professor Tesla must not end up in their hands.” There was a determined look in 
Captain Anderson‘s eyes as he looked toward the darkened area in front. “Even if we 
end up with his dead body, we have to bring him back regardless.” 

 


